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MICROSOFT’S DATA STRATEGY DRIVES 
AUTONOMOUS ERP 
SUMMARY 
As organizations transition legacy systems to the cloud, Microsoft takes a thoughtful, 
phased approach with its cloud-based Dynamics 365 autonomous ERP solutions. This 
enterprise resource planning (ERP) platform supports essential business functions and 
allows organizations to prioritize specific areas for migration — such as manufacturing, 
HR, supply chain, or finance — to ensure a smooth transition while maintaining 
operational continuity. 

Microsoft draws on its strong, integrated platform to deliver advantages across multiple 
areas of its autonomous ERP solutions. Modern ERP systems are critical for 
transforming business operations. Successful adoption of these solutions benefits from 
a strong platform approach and requires careful planning to address change 
management and data management challenges. Dynamics 365 stands out for its focus 
on data management and AI embedded into business processes. Indeed, solving the 
challenges of data management is critical for enabling an enterprise to adopt AI more 
quickly. Supported by the Microsoft FastTrack program and its proprietary Success by 
Design framework, Microsoft provides tools to reduce implementation risks, making 
Dynamics 365 a practical solution for organizations managing complex enterprise 
needs. 

This report explores the next generation of ERP systems, highlighting the role of AI-
powered agents in automating and orchestrating routine tasks while enhancing 
business processes with continuous oversight. The recent emergence of these 
autonomous agents has led to immediate positive impacts on a variety of use cases. 
These advancements also align with the principles of Industry 5.0, emphasizing 
collaboration between humans and AI to create more strategic and efficient operations. 
Overall, Dynamics 365 is positioned to support organizations in improving efficiency, 
enabling data-driven decisions, and adapting to evolving market conditions. 

MICROSOFT’S DATA STRATEGY IN ERP — A PRACTICAL OVERVIEW 
Microsoft’s data strategy in ERP focuses on the key principles of unification and 
extensibility, governance, and continuous improvement to address the challenges of 
data fragmentation, regulatory compliance, and the need for real-time insights. 
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UNIFICATION AND EXTENSIBILITY — CONNECTING DATA ACROSS THE ENTERPRISE 
Microsoft’s approach to unifying enterprise data is structured around multiple layers. 
The business applications layer includes Dynamics 365 autonomous ERP and CRM 
applications, while the productivity data layer encompasses Microsoft 365 tools such as 
Word, Excel, PowerPoint, and Teams. The Azure data and IoT layer supports cloud 
infrastructure and IoT data management. The newly added AI layer integrates agents 
built and managed in Copilot Studio, which can be extended using Copilot Connectors 
to automate tasks, enhance workflows, and provide tailored insights. 

The company has gone to great lengths to ensure that all aspects of data management 
and ERP work together harmoniously. Dataverse acts as a central data platform, 
offering a unified data model for Dynamics 365 and Power Platform applications. 
Microsoft Fabric supports analytics with OneLake for data storage and management, 
along with dedicated tools for integration with third-party systems from SAP, Oracle, and 
other vendors. There are also specialized functions for processing large datasets and 
for reporting. Dynamics 365 ERP solutions can be further extended with the Power 
Platform, which adds low-code tools for custom application development, workflow 
automation, and AI integration. For even more functionality, organizations can access 
thousands of industry-specific applications via Microsoft AppSource that independent 
software vendors (ISVs) have tailor-made for Dynamics 365. 

Other components within the platform enable enterprise-wide data integration and 
workflow coordination. This interconnected system improves data flow and analytics 
across business applications, productivity tools, and cloud services. 

GOVERNANCE — ENSURING COMPLIANCE AND SECURITY 
In a complex regulatory environment, Microsoft prioritizes data governance and 
compliance through both native capabilities in Dynamics 365 and its broader portfolio. 
For example, Microsoft Purview, a data governance, compliance, and risk management 
platform, provides tools to monitor data usage and adhere to GDPR, HIPAA, and CCPA 
regulations. Meanwhile, Dynamics 365 itself offers built-in features for security, data 
retention, and auditing, ensuring that organizations can maintain detailed logs, 
implement role-based access controls, and enforce compliance policies throughout their 
operations. This integrated approach helps enterprises address legal risks and stay 
focused on core business activities. More specifically, it enables different parts of an 
organization to work together on data while following the governance and compliance 
rules set by tenant administrators. 
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Microsoft also draws on its long background in security, which helps it safeguard data 
and applications with multiple levels of cybersecurity, including endpoint security. This 
includes physical management measures such as access control. 

CONTINUOUS IMPROVEMENT — LEVERAGING AI FOR ONGOING OPTIMIZATION 
Beyond static data management, Microsoft enables enterprises to drive continuous 
improvement through AI-powered business performance analytics integrated into Power 
BI and available within Dynamics 365 workflows. For instance, predictive analytics can 
identify patterns in supply chain data to improve efficiency and responsiveness. This 
promotes a continuous improvement cycle, allowing enterprises to adapt quickly to 
market changes. 

Microsoft’s ERP data strategy focuses on unifying data sources, maintaining 
compliance, and enabling continuous improvement. This approach makes data a 
valuable asset for enterprises, strengthening their ability to address challenges, adopt 
AI, and operate effectively. 

KEY BUSINESS OUTCOMES AND DIFFERENTIATORS OF MICROSOFT 
DYNAMICS 365 AS AN AUTONOMOUS ERP 
Dynamics 365 aims to assist enterprises in achieving crucial business objectives, 
including by customizing the system to align with industry-specific requirements. 
Microsoft differentiates itself in the ERP market by focusing on composability, 
connectivity, and cognitive capabilities, embedding AI to enhance functionality and user 
experience. Here’s a closer look at the solution’s key features and how they benefit 
enterprises. 

COMPOSABILITY — TAILORED SOLUTIONS 
Dynamics 365 offers a modular approach, allowing enterprises to choose and combine 
components that fit their needs. For example, a manufacturer might start with Dynamics 
365 ERP to streamline accounting and improve cash flow, then add supply chain 
management (SCM) as the company scales to manage production and inventory. 
Power Platform and Copilot Studio enable non-technical users to create custom 
applications to address unique scenarios using low-code/no-code interfaces. This 
composability leads to increased operational efficiency and cost savings because 
enterprises can adopt only those functionalities they need and then scale them as 
required. 



 
 
 

Page 4 Microsoft’s Data Strategy Drives ERP Transformation March 2025 
Copyright © 2025 Moor Insights & Strategy 

CONNECTIVITY — UNIFIED SYSTEMS AND DATA 
Dynamics 365 connects various ERP modules (e.g., Finance, Commerce, Project 
Operations, Supply Chain Management, Field Service, and Human Resources) and 
integrates with third-party systems through the Power Platform. This allows enterprises 
to unify their data, breaking down silos. For example, a retail company can link real-time 
sales, inventory, and financial data to improve forecasting and automate restocking. The 
platform also supports thousands of third-party integrations via connectors, enabling a 
logistics company, for instance, to integrate ERP with a transportation management 
system and use AI to analyze shipping performance. This connectivity among functions 
enables improved decision-making and enhanced customer experiences as enterprises 
leverage a holistic view of their operations and customer interactions. 

COGNITIVE CAPABILITIES — EMBEDDED AI FOR AUTONOMOUS OPERATIONS 
AI is embedded throughout Dynamics 365 to provide insights and automate processes. 
AI-powered agents analyze data from Microsoft’s own productivity applications, IoT 
sensors, forecasts, third-party systems, and other sources. For example, productivity 
data in the Microsoft Graph and business process data from Microsoft Dataverse can be 
used to measure employee productivity, manage approvals, and optimize workflows. 
Agents can automate repetitive tasks, minimize errors in critical processes, provide 
timely customer insights, monitor cash flow trends, and ensure that projects stay on 
track with deadlines and budgets. Even better, these agents adapt over time, allowing 
users to refine their logic to meet specific needs. 

In the bigger picture, Microsoft Copilot (more on that below) and agents work together to 
introduce new methods for autonomously managing tasks and whole workflows — 
ultimately creating fundamental improvements to business operations. This approach 
mitigates potential risks, expedites key processes in finance and other functions, and 
supports service teams in meeting end-customer needs. 

By combining these capabilities, Dynamics 365 helps enterprises create scalable, 
connected, and intelligent solutions tailored to their operational requirements. 

MICROSOFT DYNAMICS 365 — UNIFYING BUSINESS OPERATIONS 
WITH AI-POWERED INSIGHTS 
Microsoft delivers a unified platform by combining a comprehensive suite of tools that 
integrate various business operations, offering an efficient approach for enterprises 
across different industries and sizes. At its core, the platform addresses key business 
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functions through specialized modules for finance, supply chain, commerce, human 
resources, and project operations. These modules are designed to work harmoniously, 
allowing data to flow between different business functions and providing a holistic view 
of operations. 

This platform stands out for its integration of advanced AI capabilities. Working together, 
Copilot, Copilot Studio, and agents serve as foundational components of an 
autonomous ERP system. Copilot now serves as the adaptive AI interface to interact 
with agents, which are created, managed, and governed in Copilot Studio. Agents are 
designed to automate and execute business processes, working either alongside 
individuals or independently on behalf of teams or organizations. These agents 
continuously learn by analyzing workflows and suggesting updates to their logic, which 
users can review and approve. For enterprises with specific requirements, Copilot 
Studio also enables the creation of custom agents. These can address a huge variety of 
tasks and improve processes across many different business functions. Microsoft 
customers are already using Copilot Studio to create agents that handle time-intensive 
monitoring and information-gathering steps; for example, this can free up staff time for 
skilled human analysis, accelerate client onboarding, and even carry out some aspects 
of legal due diligence. Ultimately, automating manual tasks and streamlining complex 
processes enables faster decisions and enhances operational efficiency. 

The platform’s data architecture is built on a solid foundation that ensures continuous 
data flow and management. The Common Data Platform facilitates data unification 
across all functions, while Microsoft Dataverse serves as a centralized storage and 
management system. Microsoft Fabric, a data platform that provides tools covering the 
entire data lifecycle, supports advanced analytics and data integration, enabling 
enterprises to derive meaningful insights from their operations. This approach gives 
enterprises a clearer picture of everything going on to help them make smarter 
decisions. 

One example of this is provided by Visual Comfort & Co., a high-end lighting designer 
and manufacturer, which built a unified view of its business using Microsoft Fabric. 
Visual Comfort & Co. adopted Microsoft Dynamics 365 for its direct-to-consumer 
business, plugged into SAP and Oracle’s JD Edwards enterprise resource planning 
software, which manages the manufacturing and wholesale side of the business. This 
approach consolidated product and customer data in one place, creating a unified 
platform across stores, online, manufacturing, and shipping to streamline operations 
and improve visibility across the company’s complex supply chain. 

https://www.forbes.com/sites/moorinsights/2024/12/12/microsoft-fabric-simplifies-data-management-for-ai/
https://www.microsoft.com/en/customers/story/21012-visual-comfort-and-co-dynamics-365
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Microsoft also integrates security into its platform to safeguard sensitive data and 
minimize the risk of breaches. It also offers a scalable design that allows enterprises to 
adapt as their needs evolve. 

ENTERPRISE BENEFITS OF AUTONOMOUS ERP 
Microsoft emphasizes how AI-driven features in Dynamics 365 ERP have shown their 
worth in helping customers control costs, mitigate risks, improve compliance, and 
increase revenue. For example, machine learning and predictive analytics have been 
used for years within Dynamics 365 for analyzing historical and real-time data to 
forecast demand and fine-tune the supply chain; this helps retailers, manufacturers, and 
others satisfy customer demand and increase sales. AI-driven functions also help 
reduce costs, for example by predicting when equipment needs maintenance, which 
can prevent expensive breakdowns and outages. The compliance and risk mitigation 
measures mentioned earlier have also been augmented with generative AI features to 
make them even more effective. 

These AI tools also provide real-time analytics to address specific challenges and are 
adaptable across industries. For instance, they can optimize workflows in retail or 
improve supply chain management in manufacturing. Dynamics 365’s scalable design 
accommodates enterprises of all sizes, including multi-site deployments. 

Microsoft has recently introduced prebuilt autonomous AI agents for Dynamics 365 ERP 
and CRM to enhance functionality further. These agents automate routine tasks such as 
supplier communications, financial reconciliation, and time and expense entry, allowing 
employees to focus on higher-value activities. For example, the Supplier 
Communications Agent works from data in Dataverse to autonomously contact 
suppliers to confirm deliveries, identify potential delays, and mitigate them by 
implementing corrective actions and involving human procurement specialists as 
needed. This helps companies build and maintain supply chain resilience. 

ERP IMPLEMENTATIONS CONSIDERATIONS WITH DYNAMICS 365 
Implementing autonomous ERP solutions from Dynamics 365 requires planning and 
attention to several operational factors. Key areas to address include change 
management, data management, security, data quality, and using advanced analytics 
and reporting to extract maximal value from the system. 
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Change management ensures the organization is prepared for the transition; this 
requires a structured approach for training teams and adapting processes. Data 
management involves migrating information from legacy systems, setting up robust 
security protocols, and ensuring data accuracy. Assigning clear ownership and 
responsibilities for data is essential to maintain its integrity and usability. 

 
Success by Design maps the Dynamic 365 implementation lifecycle into four methodology phases: initiate, 

implement, prepare, and operate. – Image from Microsoft. 
 
Microsoft’s FastTrack program supports complex Dynamics 365 implementations for 
eligible customers, typically large enterprises, by offering expert guidance, deep-dive 
workshops, and tools such as the Dynamics 365 Implementation Portal. FastTrack 
follows a three-stage process: Envision (planning and goal setting), Onboard (system 
and project preparation), and Drive Value (ensuring adoption and long-term success). It 
integrates with the Success by Design framework, which uses structured workshops, 
best practices, success metrics, and actionable guidance to establish transparent 
governance, support robust solution architectures, ensure data integrity, and monitor 
project health. While FastTrack emphasizes deployment, migrations, and performance 
optimization, Success by Design addresses governance, solution architecture, and 
scalability. Together, they create a comprehensive approach, helping teams manage 

https://www.microsoft.com/en-us/dynamics-365/fast-track-implementation
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risks, build secure and scalable solutions, align projects with business objectives, and 
ensure predictability in each phase, leading to smoother implementations. 

Enterprises including the NORMA Group, a German manufacturer serving industries 
such as automotive and aviation, and Lifetime Products, a U.S. producer of sports and 
outdoor goods, have leveraged Microsoft’s FastTrack program to support their 
Dynamics 365 implementation. NORMA Group successfully centralized its operations 
by consolidating eleven ERP systems into Dynamics 365, improving collaboration, 
security, and supply chain efficiency. Lifetime Products addressed planning and 
performance issues and reduced master planning time from 24 hours to 15 minutes and 
material requirements planning (MRP) from five hours to 15 minutes. While not a 
replacement for an implementation partner, FastTrack complements the work of such 
partners by providing access to Microsoft’s architects and product teams. 

MATURITY MODEL — THE DATA JOURNEY WITH DYNAMICS 365 ERP 
SOLUTIONS 
Microsoft’s strategic framework presents a phased approach for implementing 
autonomous ERP, guiding enterprises from basic assistance to full process autonomy 
and continuous innovation. Each phase demonstrates how Copilot and agents in 
Dynamics 365 can transition operations from simple task automation to intelligent 
orchestration, with a focus on scalability and measurable results. 

In the first phase, “Assist — Redefining the Way Individuals Work,” enterprises 
incorporate AI assistance within their ERP systems to automate repetitive tasks and 
improve individual productivity. AI-powered tools manage routine activities such as 
report generation, data entry, and financial reconciliations. For example, an autonomous 
time and expense agent can use calendar data to simplify submissions, reducing the 
time spent on administrative tasks and enabling faster invoicing. This approach 
improves accuracy and replaces manual tracking with automated processes. 

In phase two, “Advise — Using AI to Interpret Data and Drive Insights,” AI takes on an 
advisory role, assisting with workflows and providing insights to improve decision-
making across departments. It evaluates data to enhance tasks such as inventory 
management, financial forecasting, and supply chain operations. For example, an AI-
driven supplier communications agent automates handling of purchase order changes 
by communicating with suppliers, updates order statuses, evaluates downstream 
impacts, and advises on alternative ways to mitigate any disruptions. This allows 

https://www.microsoft.com/en/customers/story/1688928669774993110-norma-group-dynamics-365-finance-supply-chain-management-germany
https://www.microsoft.com/en/customers/story/1781528235892219388-lifetime-azure-consumer-goods-en-united-states#project-details-section
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procurement teams to focus on supplier relationships while reducing delays and 
improving customer satisfaction. 

In the third phase, “Optimize — Full Process Autonomy,” enterprises implement 
autonomous ERP, where AI agents manage entire processes independently. These 
agents handle tasks and workflows while adapting to real-time data to optimize 
operations continuously. For example, an account reconciliation agent autonomously 
matches subledger and general ledger accounts, reducing the need for finance teams to 
perform manual checks. This automation speeds up the financial close process, 
minimizes errors, and ensures accurate data for compliance. 

In the final phase, “Extending Capabilities with Microsoft Copilot Studio,” enterprises 
prioritize continuous improvement by building custom AI agents within Copilot Studio to 
address specific business requirements. This allows for development of workflows that 
connect departments and improve collaboration. For example, a custom AI agent might 
manage global supply chain logistics by integrating regional data and optimizing 
delivery schedules, thus reducing costs and improving customer satisfaction. Manual 
oversight gives way to autonomous operations to increase efficiency and lower risks. 

These four phases demonstrate how AI in ERP can simplify tasks, reduce errors, 
improve collaboration, and support ongoing process improvements. Crucially for the 
sake of implementation, process improvements can be stepped up in complexity and 
scope over time as the organization becomes more mature in its understanding and 
application of AI-driven functions. 

CONSIDERATIONS FOR ADOPTING DYNAMICS 365 
Enterprises evaluating Dynamics 365 should consider several key factors to ensure the 
platform fits their needs. Flexible pricing and licensing options allow organizations to 
choose solutions that align with their budget and operational scale. Dynamics 365 is a 
cloud-based SaaS solution providing automatic updates and reduced IT maintenance. 
This ensures enterprises can always access the latest features and security updates 
without requiring manual upgrades, simplifying system management. The platform also 
offers strong mobile accessibility, enabling users to work from anywhere — a critical 
feature in today’s remote and mobile work environments. 

Sustainability is also an important consideration. Microsoft integrates sustainability into 
the design and operations of Dynamics 365 to help organizations reduce their 
environmental impacts and meet corporate social responsibility goals. The Sustainability 
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Manager enables organizations to record, report, and reduce carbon emissions. Built on 
the Power Platform and following the Greenhouse Gas Protocol, this cloud-based model 
tracks carbon emissions across three scopes: direct emissions (Scope 1), indirect 
emissions from energy use (Scope 2), and other indirect emissions throughout the value 
chain (Scope 3). It collects and processes data from field operations and the supply 
chain to provide insights for reducing emissions. 

Data privacy and ethical AI use considerations are also becoming increasingly important 
as AI adoption grows in ERP systems. Microsoft emphasizes responsible AI practices, 
ensuring the transparency of algorithms and compliance with data privacy regulations. 

MICROSOFT’S COMPETITIVE EDGE AND CHALLENGERS 
Microsoft’s strength in the cloud ERP market comes not only from the many functions 
and AI within Dynamics 365 ERP solutions, but also from integrating with the company’s 
extensive ecosystem, including Azure for cloud services, Dynamics 365 customer 
engagement and service apps (CRM), Power BI for analytics, and Office plus Teams for 
productivity and collaboration. This setup makes it easier for enterprises to use ERP 
alongside other essential tools, including many they may already be using. 

Various ERP providers offer AI-driven systems tailored to different industries and 
requirements. Some focus on advanced analytics and cloud-based tools, while others 
emphasize industry-specific features or scalability. Tailored solutions are available for 
sectors such as manufacturing, healthcare, retail, aerospace, defense, utilities, and 
financial management, as well as for organizations ranging in size from smaller 
enterprises to the largest companies. 

Dynamics 365 focuses on modular setup, AI-driven processes, and ease of use, 
offering flexibility and scalability. Still, challenges in implementation, data migration, and 
employee adoption can arise. Microsoft addresses these with its FastTrack program, 
partner network, and other resources designed to help enterprises manage the 
transition effectively. 

FUTURE OUTLOOK 
As AI becomes a central feature of ERP systems, Dynamics 365 is already helping 
enterprises across the finance, healthcare, retail, and manufacturing sectors enhance 
their operations. For example, Schréder — a major outdoor lighting provider whose 
projects include the Champs-Elysées in Paris and the Channel Tunnel — used 
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Dynamics 365 to replace and unify 11 legacy ERP systems. This transformation has 
eliminated misalignments, improved quality and productivity, reduced costs, and 
simplified tax calculations across multiple international jurisdictions. 

In healthcare, Lancet Laboratories uses Dynamics 365 Finance and Supply Chain 
Management to enable the complex materials handling, tracking, and pricing required 
for more than 550 points of presence across Lancet’s South Africa operations. Direct 
Customer Solutions, a third-party logistics provider in the pharmaceutical industry, uses 
Dynamics 365 Finance, Supply Chain Management, and Sales, as well as multiple 
automations using Power Platform, to centralize data as it delivers critical medications 
to hospitals, pharmacies, doctors, and patients as affordably as possible. This has 
simplified workflows and enabled DCS to process higher volumes of transactions as 
volumes have increased from 150 orders per day to 75 orders per hour. 

Meanwhile, in the financial sector, Old Mutual adopted Dynamics 365 Finance to 
establish a global connection among its business units; this move created a unified 
platform equipped with standardized processes, AI capabilities, and enhanced visibility 
through automation. In retail, Build-A-Bear uses Dynamics 365 to optimize fulfillment 
and offer an integrated shopping experience across channels. 

Looking forward, Microsoft plans to expand its AI capabilities within Dynamics 365 by 
introducing more advanced autonomous agents, enhanced predictive analytics and 
actionable insights, and adaptive Copilot workspaces across ERP functionalities. While 
potential challenges in user adoption and seamless implementation must always be 
taken seriously, Microsoft’s focus on scalable, autonomous ERP solutions positions it as 
a significant player in shaping the future of ERP systems. Delaying cloud adoption could 
leave enterprises behind in critical areas like AI innovation and cybersecurity, which 
underscores the importance of adopting cloud-based, AI-driven tools for modern 
operations. 
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